
INDIA’S 100 BEST 
DESTINATIONS

INDIA, THIS GLORIOUS 
country of ours and the birthplace 
of a great civilisation, is a land full 

of rich history and diversity, a 
melting pot of cultures and a land 
which embodies beauty as few others 
do. It is always a pleasure to lay 
hands on a book that so beautifully 
captures the variegated essence of 
our gorgeous country.

India’s 100 Best Destinations is a 
coffee-table book that showcases our 
country as never before. Bob 
Rupani, one of India’s most 
respected automotive journalists, has 
written this book on the basis of his 
own travels through the length and 
breadth of our country. Therefore, 
this book is a must for  travellers, 
adventure lovers and general readers 
who want to know more about India.

The layout of this 157-page coffee-
table book is simple, clear and highly 
attractive with an array of 
breathtaking pictures. Showcasing 
some of the most must-visit 
destinations in India, the author 
promises to take the reader on an 
unforgettable visual travelogue: from 
the Himalayas to the Western Ghats, 
from the Thar Desert to Goa’s sun-
kissed beaches and from barren 
lands to rich tropical rainforests. The 
book features incredible places 
spread all over the country.

The author invites you to explore 
India’s rich past, diverse cultures, 
stunning geography, a mosaic of 
picturesque hill stations, valleys, 
mountain ranges, wildlife sanctuaries 
and the people who make up India.

Bob Rupani belongs to the 

pioneering lot of Indian automotive 
journalists, having started out with 
the ‘Indian Auto Journal’ in 1986. He 
is the editor of the ‘Auto India’ 
magazine. He has raced cars  and also 
customised and traded in them. Over 
the years he has clocked almost 20 
lakh kilometres on Indian roads. 
Apart from India’s 100 Best 
Destinations, Bob Rupani has also 
written Driving Holidays in India.

– Sayem Parvez Syed
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